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The COMET process is 
unique. It recognises 
that emphasis on the 
‘Discover’ phase of event 
investigation generates 
high quality input data 
and gives you a solid 
foundation for making 
sound decisions for future 
prevention.

As a COMET user, you 
will have access to our 
package of customisable 
training options, designed 
to provide you with 
the tools to perform a 
thorough and robust 
investigation, establish 
root causes and identify 
improvements that 
prevent repeated failures.

COMET is the first 
commercially available 
investigation and 
root cause analysis 
methodology to include 
human factors (HF) 
analysis. 

When an element of 
human error directly 
contributes to an 
incident / performance 
loss, COMET’s HF tool 
helps you to identify the 
first failure stage, what 
Performing Influencing 
Factors (PIFs) contributed 

COMET Root App brings a 
digital dimension to your 
incident investigations and 
root cause analysis. Using 
the COMET methodology, 
the web app allows you to 
capture, track and measure 
all aspects of an incident 
investigation online.

Our mobile friendly web 
app, COMET Root App 
Expert Extensions, assists 
you with process guidance 
and subject matter 
expertise during the 
key stages of a COMET 
investigation.

It’s a proven incident
investigation, root cause
analysis and prevention
methodology

It’s multiple
training options

It’s a first for
human factors analysis

It’s a secure
web app

It’s subject matter
expertise online
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